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LATEST NEWS FROM THE PARISH COUNCIL 

Upcoming events! 

King's Coronation Event 

Sunday 7th May 2023 

2-6pm at Mattishall 

Sports and Social Club 

Come along to join us for a 
spectacular village event 
celebrating the King's 
Coronation. 

There will be stalls, games, 
ice creams, face painting, 
BBQ, archery, axe throwing, 
cave sims, children's tea 
party, the big afternoon tea 
and much more. 

We also have the ABC Blues 
Brothers band playing. 

May Elections 

Ordinary elections are held 
every fourth year on the first 
Thursday in May, with the 
next election due on 4 May 
2023. 

Nominations are to be 
received no later than the 
4th April at 4pm and MUST 
be delivered by hand to 
Breckland District Council. 

If you are interested in 
• becoming a Councillor 

please visit Breckland 
District Council website 

www.breckland.qov.uk/ 
elections/2023/d istrict­

or alternatively contact the 
Parish Clerk for a 
nomination form. 

http://mattishallpc.info 

https:// 

parish 

Mattishall Neighbourhood Plan 
The Mattishall Neighbourhood Plan Steering Group recently carried 

out a community consultation exercise to find out how you would like 

the village to evolve into the future. We asked three questions: 

What do you think works well in the village- What doesn't work so 

well-, and What do you see should be the priorities for the future? 

The Parish Council would like to thank all of you who submitted your 

views- we really do appreciate it. We have received over 100 

responses from you both online and via the questionnaires in 

Miscellanea. The summary of your responses are as follows: 

What works well? 

Sense of community • Shops/cafes/PO etc, village facilities • 

Village location • GP Surgery • Access to the countryside 

What doesn't work well? 

Parking- village centre and near Mattishall News • Pharmacy* 

GP Surgery • Bus service** • Traffic • Over development 

Priorities for change 

Improve Pharmacy and GP access/service* • Improve bus service** 

Limit further development • Improve village appearance • 

Improve parking • Reduce speeding traffic 

* The survey was carried out at the time of high demand together with 

other issues affecting the surgery and Pharmacy 

** The survey was carried out before the bus timetable/frequency was 

changed in February. 

Your survey findings will help shape the policies and projects that will 

be included in the new Plan. Our planning consultants are now 

preparing the next stage and we will be going out to ask your views 

again. We need to ensure we have a Plan that will mean Mattishall 

remains a great place to live and that any future development has a 

positive impact on our village. 

We will be holding a "drop-in" session where you will be able to view 

our draft proposals and find out more about what we are proposing. 

Please come along and have your say on the important final shape of 

the Plan. 

Mattishall Neighbourhood Plan- Have your Say, Drop in Session 

DATE: 24th April 2023 

TIME: 10:30 - 18:45 

VENUE: South Green Business Park (Poultec) 

clerk@mattishallpc.info 
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